
PROJECT: Roof Replacement at Various Buildings & Service Center

PROJECT NUMBER: 2016136.00

BID OPENING DATE & 

TIME: Wednesday, February 22, 2017 @ 2:00 PM CONTRACT: GENERAL CONSTRUCTION

BIDDERS
ATLANTIC 

ROOFING

BUDGET 

RENOVATION & 

ROOFING, INC.

D.A. NOLT, INC.
DAVID RANDALL 

ASSOCIATES, INC.

DEZIGNS 

CONSTRUCTION, 

INC.

JLK CONTRACTING, 

INC.

JM YOUNG & 

SONS, INC.
JOTTAN, INC.

BASE BID  NO BID 

BASE BID NO. 1 - 

GYWNEDD SQ
959,000.00$     803,013.00$     794,000.00$       No Bid No Bid 836,850.00$        834,337.00$      

BASE BID NO. 2 - 

WALTON FARM 
No Bid 773,704.00$     749,000.00$       No Bid No Bid 839,325.00$        776,179.00$      

BASE BID NO. 3 - 

PENNDALE MS No Bid 667,521.00$     799,500.00$       No Bid No Bid 711,850.00$        No Bid
BASE BID NO. 4 - 

NORTHBRIDGE No Bid 61,912.00$       84,500.00$         No Bid No Bid 83,325.00$          No Bid

BASE BID NO. 5 - 

SUPPORT SVCS
No Bid 408,282.00$     263,900.00$       307,200.00$       290,400.00$       244,500.00$        293,279.00$      

ALTERNATES

GC-1 -Roof Inspector -

Gwynedd Square ES .
32,000.00$        15,000.00$       46,000.00$         No Bid No Bid 48,600.00$          46,750.00$        

GC-2 - Roof Inspector - 

Walton Farm ES.
No Bid 15,000.00$       44,160.00$         No Bid No Bid 45,100.00$          43,945.00$        

GC-3 - Roof Inspector-

Penndale MS. No Bid 15,000.00$       50,600.00$         No Bid No Bid 45,100.00$          No Bid
GC-4 -Roof Inspector -

Northbridge. No Bid 2,500.00$         5,520.00$           No Bid No Bid 5,250.00$            No Bid

GC-5 -Roof Inspector- 

Support Services Center.
No Bid 10,000.00$       18,400.00$         10,000.00$         39,500.00$         13,900.00$          16,830.00$        

GC-6 - Joint sealant-

Gwynedd Square ES.
10,200.00$        7,325.00$         6,000.00$           No Bid No Bid 2,970.00$            14,900.00$        

GC-7 - Joint sealant- 

Walton Farm 
No Bid 7,325.00$         6,900.00$           No Bid No Bid 2,970.00$            14,900.00$        

TOTAL 746,933.00$  

BIDDERS
LIBERTY 

ROOFING, INC.

MARTIN ROOFING 

& CONSTRUCTION

MCMULLEN 

ROOFING, INC.

MIKE KOBITHEN 

ROOFING & 

INSULATION

MUNN ROOFING 

CORP.

PANEKO 

CONTRUCTION, 

INC.

PRO COM 

ROOFING CORP.

TRS ROOFING, 

INC.

BASE BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

BASE BID NO. 1 - 

GYWNEDD SQ
No Bid 758,000.00$       942,800.00$       No Bid 645,000.00$        

BASE BID NO. 2 - 

WALTON FARM 
No Bid 745,000.00$       894,000.00$       No Bid 638,000.00$        

BASE BID NO. 3 - 

PENNDALE MS No Bid 800,000.00$       858,000.00$       No Bid No BidBASE BID NO. 4 - 

NORTHBRIDGE No Bid 97,800.00$         68,000.00$         No Bid No Bid

BASE BID NO. 5 - 

SUPPORT SVCS
412,102.00$     353,512.00$       318,000.00$       537,777.00$       216,000.00$        

ALTERNATES

GC-1 -Roof Inspector -

Gwynedd Square ES .
No Bid 28,820.00$         40,000.00$         No Bid 18,000.00$          

GC-2 - Roof Inspector - 

Walton Farm ES.
No Bid 28,090.00$         36,000.00$         No Bid 18,000.00$          

GC-3 - Roof Inspector-

Penndale MS.
No Bid 35,000.00$         36,000.00$         No Bid No Bid

GC-4 -Roof Inspector -

Northbridge. No Bid 8,000.00$           6,000.00$           No Bid No Bid

GC-5 -Roof Inspector- 

Support Services Center.
30,000.00$       17,870.00$         12,000.00$         1,500.00$           3,750.00$            

GC-6 - Joint sealant-

Gwynedd Square ES. No Bid 6,200.00$           4,000.00$           No Bid 3,000.00$            

GC-7 - Joint sealant- 

Walton Farm 
No Bid 6,200.00$           4,000.00$           No Bid 3,000.00$            

TOTAL 1,544,750.00$  


